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The  
Arthur Miller Centennial  

 
October 16-18, 2015 

 
Sponsored by the Arthur Miller Society 

at 

St. Francis College 
Brooklyn, New York 

 
The Twelfth International Arthur Miller 
Conference will center on the observance of 
the 100th anniversary of Arthur Miller’s birth 
in New York City on October 17, 1915. We are 
pleased to return to St. Francis College in 
Brooklyn Heights, the neighborhood where 
Arthur Miller lived the in 1940s and 50s.  
 
We seek papers on any aspect of the dramatic 
and non-dramatic work that Miller produced 
in his stellar career. We invite discussions 
from all critical and performance 
perspectives. We also are interested in 
analysis of Miller as a political and cultural 
figure, his connection to and influence on 
other playwrights, and comparative studies. 
 
The conference also wants to include 
discussion of the artistic relationship 
between Arthur Miller and his wife Inge 
Morath, the world-renowned photojournalist. 
The society desires to provide a venue for 
academic inquiry into how Miller and Morath 
collaborated on their books of 
photojournalism and dramatic productions 
and how they informed each other’s art, 
aesthetics, and politics. The conference will 
feature of photo exhibit of Morath’s work 
provided by her foundation. 
 
The conference also will include panels 
comprised of playwrights, theatre critics, 
actors, and directors. In addition, we plan 
staged readings and performances of Miller’s 
work. 
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